
BRANDIT WEAR, INC.
PRIVACY CHOICES

This page allows you to exercise your data privacy 
rights. Please carefully read our Privacy Policy at 
https://www.brandit-wear.us/privacypolicy and 
https://www.brandit-wear.us/ccpa-notice  
to understand your data protection/privacy rights  and 
the steps we take to respond to your request.

To exercise your data privacy rights, please complete 
the following required information and send the com-
pleted form to info@brandit-wear.us

If you are a resident of the European Union, please 
refer to https://www.brandit-wear.com/informationen/
datenschutz/ for your data subject request questions.

Please note since we do not sell your personal infor-
mation or share your personal information for cross-
context behavioral advertising ( targeted advertising), 
we cannot respond to your request to opt-out of sale 
or sharing of personal information.

Our website uses Google Analystics to track the usage 
and performance of our website. For more information 
about how Google Analytics collects and processes 
information on the website please access: https://poli-
cies.google.com/technologies/partner-sites.

If you prefer an alternative option to exercise your data 
privacy rights, please give us a call at  
1-833-858-1200. We also accept your data access 
request via email at info@brandit-wear.us

BRANDIT WEAR, INC. 
1209 Orange Street, Wilmington DE 19801 USA 
info@brandit-wear.us | www.brandit-wear.us

PERSONAL INFORMATION

First Name Last Name

E-Mail Phone No. (optional)

You are a Country of residence

State of residence Your Privacy Request

Additional Notes or Comments (optional)
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